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RAD DOG TRAINING Program Services (Extensive) 

Cloé Server 
ABC Certified Dog Trainer 
2175 Del Monte Dr., San Pablo, CA, 94806 
Newdogserver@gmail.com 
(510) 759-4280 

All programs represent services for one individual dog. Multiple dogs must have separate agreements. 

“ABC Certified Dog Trainer: ABC Certified Dog Trainers have successfully completed a dog training 
program that falls in the Balanced Trainer category.  While the ABC Dog Training Program is an 
overwhelmingly positive-motivation-based program, it is ABC’s position that it is unlikely you will be able 
to desensitize every dog to every possible distraction using positive reinforcement and negative 
punishment alone. It is important to understand that I do not encourage the use of negative 
reinforcement or positive punishment.” -Cloe Server 

Behavior/Temperament Assessment ($50.00 per 30-45min session):  

A mandatory evaluation to determine behavior and temperament must be scheduled separately prior to 
any program’s first training session. 

Problem Solving Program ($65.00 per 50-minute session): 

Effective behavior-problem solving is essential toward creating successful and harmonious dog and 
owner relationships. Clients will ask for solutions to a wide variety of behavior problems they are 
experiencing with their dogs. In order to help my clients, there must be an understanding of the basics 
of problem solving in order to provide a range of solutions. Examples of problem solving include: 

• Jumping (excludes “over fences”, see Behavior Modification Program below) 

• Puppy Nipping and Mouthing 

• Unruly Behavior in the House 

• Begging 

• Stealing Food from Counters 

• Excessive Barking 

• Inappropriate Chewing 

• Coprophagia (Stool Eating) 

• Housetraining 

• Digging 

• Bolting 

Treatment Plan Components: Positive reinforcement of alternate behaviors, management of the 
problem and setting the dog up to succeed, consequences for the problem behaviors, and consistency in 
dealing with problem behaviors.  

Required Training Equipment: To be determined by trainer upon completion of behavior assessment. 
Client must have all of the determined items. If requested, Cloé Server will provide them at a cost. 
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Behavior Modification Program ($100.00 per 50-minute session): 

Behavior Modification is the elimination, curtailment or management of a complex and sometimes 
dangerous behavior. Some of these behaviors include dog-on-dog aggression, dog-on-people 
aggression, separation anxiety, phobias, and compulsive disorders. The treatment plan for these types 
of challenges generally requires an advanced amount of knowledge and skill, and often the input of a 
qualified veterinarian.  The following will be the focus of establishing better behavior and health: 

• Canine Communication 

• Leadership Skills 

• Physical and Mental Stimulation 

 Treatment Plan Components: Positive reinforcement of alternate behaviors, management of the 
problem and setting the dog up to succeed, consequences for the problem behaviors, and consistency in 
dealing with problem behaviors.  

Required Training Equipment: 6 foot leash, clicker, treat pouch, and other equipment to be determined. 
Client must have all of the determined items. If requested, Cloé Server will provide them at a cost. 

 


